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Curriculum Area in Action - GEOGRAPHY 
 

Intent Geography gives our pupils a coherent knowledge and understanding of the world: its people, its 

composition, its history, its future. We inspire pupils' curiosity to know more about their place as global 

citizens, who will face the challenges of sustainability with confidence. We want pupils to… 

 

• Speak like a geographer: using high level geographical vocabulary to confidently discuss key 

geographical themes. 

• Think like a geographer: showing curiosity and fascination about the world and its people, 

gaining contextual knowledge of different locations, including culture, resources and 

environments. 

• Act like a geographer: experiencing fieldwork opportunities to interpret a range of 

geographical sources, collect data, analyse and communicate geographical knowledge. In 

addition to this, students will engage in sustainable behaviours in school and their own lives. 

• Read like a geographer: taking a fascination in geographical literature to further their 

geographical interest.  

 

 
Example to demonstrate expectations 

 



Every new topic should 
have a knowledge 
organiser and an 

introductory lesson 
(bridging activity) which 
focuses on map work. 
 
The first lesson of every 

unit must include 
atlases and globes. 

 

The learning objective is 
presented as a question 
which must be 
answered. These are 

referred to throughout 
the lesson. 
GDS opportunities are 
clear for students.  

 

Geography lessons will 
follow the St Stephen 
lesson structure.  

 

• Retrieval 

• Locational 

Knowledge 

• Learning Journey 

• Vocabulary 

• Curiosity  



• Cultural Capital 

• Independent Task 

• Summary 

 

Geography lessons will 
refer to aspirations 
throughout. 

  

Geographical fieldwork 
to be completed at 
least once a year. 
Evidence to be placed 

in books. 

 



One piece of extended 
writing per topic. This 
should include pictorial 

representations when 
appropriate.  
 
Extended writing should 
provide cross curricular 

opportunities such as 
the inclusion of your 
year set of Alan Peat 
sentences, “because 
answers” from guided 
reading and so forth. 

These opportunities 
should be in addition to 
the geographical skills 
on display. 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Regular opportunity for 
students to develop 
their own geographical 

opinions.  

 


